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After a lifetime of trading passion for ambition, Doctor Emily Hillard is determined to catch a killer. Instead
of being awed by her technology, the morphs pair her with the most exasperating man she has ever
encountered. He’s barbaric, domineering, and unapologetically savage. She should be frightened, or at least
repelled by his lack of sophistication. Instead, she finds him refreshing, and pictures herself crushed beneath
his strong body as he skillfully peels away her civility.

Cruz, a panther-shifter with pyrokinetic abilities, spent eleven years as an assassin before being allowed a
reprieve. He is finally enjoying some down time when a murderous rogue chooses his territory for a hideout.
Now half of Alpha Colony is searching for the rogue, and Cruz’s handlers are desperate to get their hands on
Emily’s prototype. Ordinarily Cruz would have ignored their threats and ultimatums, but he’s intrigued by
the delectable doctor. So, he decides to show the hothouse flower what life in the wild is all about.

(If you’re having trouble finding Book Three: Unwanted Desire. Type "Alpha Colony 3" in the search bar
and it will take you to the book. I'm not sure why it's being so difficult. Thanks, Aubrey.)

From Aubrey: The Alpha Colony series has always been a fan favorite and I'm hoping the re-launch will
introduce these highly erotic paranormal stories to some new readers. This series is set in the near future and
features shapeshifters, primarily feline but I throw in a wolf-shifter or two. The first book, Untamed Hunger,
is only $0.99 and the other 3 books are $1.99 each. I hope you'll check them out and enjoy!
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From reader reviews:

Frances Carlton:

This book untitled Uninhibited Fire (Alpha Colony Book 4) to be one of several books in which best seller in
this year, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy
this specific book in the book retail outlet or you can order it by using online. The publisher in this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smart phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this reserve from your list.

Jesus Brewster:

Uninhibited Fire (Alpha Colony Book 4) can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We
recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge
in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The writer giving
his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Uninhibited Fire (Alpha Colony
Book 4) but doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource data
that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial thinking.

Charlotte Neville:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Aim
to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its handle may doesn't work
this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer could be Uninhibited Fire (Alpha Colony Book 4) why because the wonderful
cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly assist you to
pick up this book.

James Ojeda:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes reading, not only science book but additionally novel and Uninhibited Fire (Alpha Colony Book
4) or even others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel
would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially.
Those books are helping them to put their knowledge. In some other case, beside science reserve, any other
book likes Uninhibited Fire (Alpha Colony Book 4) to make your spare time considerably more colorful.
Many types of book like this.
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