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Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael, 2 volume set
A JPS classic reissue of the critical volume, based on manuscript and early editions.

Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael is a classic collection of midrash. It contains commentary on a large part of the
Book of Exodus (chapters 12 to 23) and represents the two main modes of interpretation: the halakhah (legal
doctrine), and the aggadah (moral and religious teachings). The work also contains allusions to historical
events and ancient legends not found elsewhere.

A new introduction by noted scholar David Stern highlights the work, now published in a convenient two-
volume set. It retains the original text from the JPS 1933 edition, reset in a modern, readable typeface, with
Hebrew and English on facing pages and the original indexes.

This classic work is widely recognized as a model of meticulous and thorough scholarship. Its translation is
accurate, straightforward, and usable by scholars, students, and lay readers. Out of print for many years, it
will be heralded as an important reissue that should belong to every rabbi, rabbinical school, and Jewish
Studies professor, and will be an important addition to synagogue libraries and public libraries with Judaica
collections.
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From reader reviews:

Clara Palmer:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Mekhilta de-Rabbi
Ishmael, 2 volume set suitable to you? The particular book was written by well-known writer in this era. The
particular book untitled Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael, 2 volume setis the one of several books this everyone
read now. This particular book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this e-book you will
enter the new age that you ever know just before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, thus
all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world on this book.

Sarah Frigo:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the free time or they will get lots of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we will say absolutely
sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you possess when the
spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have read
is definitely Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael, 2 volume set.

Lawrence Pomerleau:

Beside this Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael, 2 volume set in your phone, it may give you a way to get more close
to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh through the
oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have
Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael, 2 volume set because this book offers to your account readable information. Do
you occasionally have book but you do not get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on, that wil happen
if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring
beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book as well as read it from currently!

Mary Otter:

Publication is one of source of information. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world. By the
book Mekhilta de-Rabbi Ishmael, 2 volume set we can consider more advantage. Don't you to be creative
people? To become creative person must like to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with this book Mekhilta de-Rabbi
Ishmael, 2 volume set. You can more desirable than now.
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