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Making their mark on Tinseltown's movers and shakers is the plan for these savvy businesswomen, but
mansions, movie stars, and temptation wait around every corner. You'll love this trilogy of sun-kissed
romances featuring three spirited friends and the men lucky enough to win their hearts:

Heart of Design: The tabloids portray flirtatious Ian O'Connor as Hollywood's latest playboy, but Sophie●

Hartland is just there to renovate his bedroom, not become another notch on his bedpost. But Ian finds her
a refreshing change from the actress wannabes trying to hop aboard his new gravy train of success. Can
Sophie ignore her traitorous libido - and, more important, can she protect her heart in this game of wills?
Planning for Love: It's time event planner Poppy Reagan took her dating life as seriously as she does her●

business. She swears off the bad boys and strategically maps out a plan to find an honest, attractive man to
become her life partner. Too bad the sexy Ohio dermatologist wooing her doesn't meet her criteria . . . until
her heart overrules her head.
Art of Affection: Holly Hartland has spent the last year in Los Angeles finalizing her divorce and getting●

her career as an art gallery curator back on track. The platonic co-parenting role she shares with LAPD
detective Gary Sumner is perfect for two people who've sworn off romance, but the burgeoning sexual
chemistry they share proves hard to ignore.

Sensuality Level: Sensual
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From reader reviews:

Matthew German:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means
that reserve has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book.
They are really reading whatever they consider because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person
who don't like examining a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult
problem or perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will require this Love, California Style: 3 Contemporary
Romances.

Nancy Jackson:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place
and notice through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated that for a
while is reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than
other is high. For you who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific Love, California Style: 3
Contemporary Romances book as starter and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than
just a book.

Julio Keith:

In this particular era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of many
books in the top list in your reading list is Love, California Style: 3 Contemporary Romances. This book
which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in becoming precious person. By
looking upwards and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Catherine Mejia:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you know
that little person just like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to something by book.
Different categories of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them are these claims
Love, California Style: 3 Contemporary Romances.
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