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One of the most remarkable books to come out of the immediate aftermath of the American Civil War was
William F.G. Shank's book on the generals he observed up close and personal all during the war. As a
correspondent for Harper's Magazine and the New York Herald, Shank followed through camp and battle,
seeing the strengths but also the foibles and failings of some of our most prominent Union leaders. This book
is his excerpt on Grant.

Shank does not shy from including illuminating details that he was later told may have offended the subjects
of his treatments. But he is admiring of the men he met and admirably creates portraits of Grant, Sherman,
Sheridan, Rousseau, Thomas, Hooker, and others that you will not read elsewhere.

As he states in the preface: "Very few generals have appeared great to the war correspondents; and though
very few of the latter can claim to be descendants of Diogenes, they can assert, with equal positiveness, that
very few of the generals have been Alexanders, and that 'the very sun shines through them.'"

Every memoir of the American Civil War provides us with another view of the catastrophe that changed the
country forever.

For the first time, this long out-of-print volume is available as an affordable, well-formatted book for e-
readers and smartphones.

Be sure to LOOK INSIDE by clicking the cover above or download a sample.

"Whether extolling or condemning, [Shanks] is always interesting." New York Evening Post.
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From reader reviews:

Pauline Lipman:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have spare time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that
question since just their can do in which. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this Ulysses S. Grant by One Who Was
There to read.

Harold Singleton:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
lots of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is
usually Ulysses S. Grant by One Who Was There.

Christopher Parker:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer might be Ulysses S. Grant by One Who Was There why because the
wonderful cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or
content is definitely fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick
up this book.

Robin Lawrence:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our understanding for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we would like. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year
had been exactly added. This book Ulysses S. Grant by One Who Was There was filled with regards to
science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading a book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to
read a book. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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