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A sparkling talent makes her fiction debut with this infectious novel that combines the charming pluck of
Eloise, the poignant psychological quirks of The Curious Incident of the Dog in the Night-Time and the
page-turning spirit of Where’d You Go, Bernadette.

Reclusive literary legend M. M. “Mimi” Banning has been holed up in her Bel Air mansion for years. But
after falling prey to a Bernie Madoff-style ponzi scheme, she’s flat broke. Now Mimi must write a new book
for the first time in decades, and to ensure the timely delivery of her manuscript, her New York publisher
sends an assistant to monitor her progress. The prickly Mimi reluctantly complies—with a few stipulations:
No Ivy-Leaguers or English majors. Must drive, cook, tidy. Computer whiz. Good with kids. Quiet, discreet,
sane.

When Alice Whitley arrives at the Banning mansion, she’s put to work right away—as a full-time
companion to Frank, the writer’s eccentric nine-year-old, a boy with the wit of Noel Coward, the wardrobe
of a 1930s movie star, and very little in common with his fellow fourth-graders.

As she slowly gets to know Frank, Alice becomes consumed with finding out who Frank’s father is, how his
gorgeous “piano teacher and itinerant male role model” Xander fits into the Banning family equation—and
whether Mimi will ever finish that book.

Full of heart and countless “only-in-Hollywood” moments, Be Frank with Me is a captivating and
unconventional story of an unusual mother and son, and the intrepid young woman who finds herself
irresistibly pulled into their unforgettable world.
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From reader reviews:

Norman Williams:

The book Be Frank With Me: A Novel give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You should use
to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting stress or having
big problem with your subject. If you can make studying a book Be Frank With Me: A Novel being your
habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a
number of or all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a guide Be Frank With
Me: A Novel. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do
you think about this reserve?

Helen Johnson:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want feel happy read one with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. The particular Be Frank
With Me: A Novel is kind of e-book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Cora Snyder:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading
book thus. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information due to the fact book is one of several ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the character types do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to some others. When you read
this Be Frank With Me: A Novel, you could tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours
publication. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Jamie Wallace:

The reason why? Because this Be Frank With Me: A Novel is an unordinary book that the inside of the
publication waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will shock you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such incredible way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning fully. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot
of rewards than the other book get such as help improving your expertise and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I were being you I will go to the reserve store
hurriedly.
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