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Edna Pontellier struggles with her role as a housewife, and yearns for social freedom. Her increasingly
unorthodox views on femininity and motherhood fuel her desires and passion, despite the prevailing social
attitudes of the South. On a quest of self discovery, Edna flees her domestic role in search of love and
spiritual freedom in a world that isn’t ready for her. The Awakening is one of the earliest novels that focuses
on women’s issues without condescension. The novel was particularly controversial upon publication
because Chopin didn’t condemn Edna’s desire for an affair. Instead, Chopin focused on human behaviour
and the complexities of social structures while exploring the banalities of everyday life and the consequences
of social norms.
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From reader reviews:

David Ochoa:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book called The Awakening?
Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's
book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have other opinion?

Todd James:

The book The Awakening give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem using your subject. If you can make studying a book The Awakening to be your habit, you can get
far more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are
able to know everything if you like wide open and read a guide The Awakening. Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Sherry Hansen:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't would
like do that. You must know how great and important the book The Awakening. All type of book are you
able to see on many methods. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Irene Hoyt:

You can get this The Awakening by go to the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could
possibly to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are
various. Not only simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In
the modern era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right
now, choose your ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you
to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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