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Joss Whedon, the pop-culture mastermind behind Buffy the Vampire Slayer, bridged the gap between his
cult-hit Firefly TV series and his Serenity motion picture with this three-issue miniseries. Penned by Whedon
and Brett Matthews, a Firefly show writer, the ragtag crew takes on a scavenger mission with the promise of
a big payoff. Only too late do they realize the gig is orchestrated by an old enemy eager to remake their
acquaintance... with the help of operatives wearing bright blue gloves.
This new oversized hardcover has a new cover by Adam Hughes and shows off the work of penciller Will
Conrad and colorist Laura Martin, and the array of pinups by phenomenal guest artists including:
John Cassaday,
Jo Chen,
Joe Quesada,
Sean Phillips,
Adam Hughes,
JG Jones,
Brian Hitch,
Josh Middleton,
Leinil Yu and
Tim Bradstreet

Also includes more than a dozen new pages with a behind-the-scenes section featuring concept and
production art from the film, by Josh Middleton & Leinil Yu and a pre-production memo to the film by
Whedon called A Brief History of the Universe, Circa 2516 A.D.
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From reader reviews:

Judy Chisolm:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you don't have
spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have free time? What did
you do? Everybody has many questions above. They have to answer that question since just their can do that
will. It said that about guide. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start from on
guardería until university need this Serenity: Those Left Behind to read.

Errol Sawyer:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Serenity: Those Left Behind, you
are able to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang type is it?
Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its known as reading friends.

Helen Williams:

Reading a book for being new life style in this season; every people loves to learn a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
due to the fact book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics,
and soon. The Serenity: Those Left Behind provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Edith Manning:

Guide is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen will need book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know those
books have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world.
With the book Serenity: Those Left Behind we can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people?
To get creative person must want to read a book. Just choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't
be doubt to change your life with that book Serenity: Those Left Behind. You can more attractive than now.
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