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Chosen as a Best Book of the Year by the The Washington Post, Publishers Weekly, and Kirkus Reviews

In this exquisitely told novel, John le Carré shows us once again his acute understanding of the world we live
in and where power really lies.
 
In the wake of the collapse of Lehman Brothers and with Britain on the brink of economic ruin, a young
English couple takes a vacation in Antigua. There they meet Dima, a Russian who styles himself the world’s
Number One money-launderer and who wants, among other things, a game of tennis. Back in London, the
couple is subjected to an interrogation by the British Secret service who also need their help. Their
acquiescence will lead them on a precarious journey through Paris to a safe house in Switzerland, helpless
pawns in a game of nations that reveals the unholy alliances between the Russian mafia, the City of London,
the government and the competing factions of the British Secret Service.
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From reader reviews:

Galen Dent:

The book Our Kind of Traitor: A Novel gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can
utilize to make your capable more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or
having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book Our Kind of Traitor: A Novel to
become your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge
about a few or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like start and read a publication Our Kind
of Traitor: A Novel. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or others. So ,
how do you think about this book?

Helen McCormick:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As you may
know that book is very important usually. The book Our Kind of Traitor: A Novel ended up being making
you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is extremely
advantages for you. The book Our Kind of Traitor: A Novel is not only giving you more new information but
also being your friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your e-book. Try to
make relationship using the book Our Kind of Traitor: A Novel. You never really feel lose out for everything
in case you read some books.

Katie Phillips:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources inside can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot
more to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book.
Examining a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Our Kind of Traitor:
A Novel book since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Sean Mills:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind expertise
or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than can satisfy
your short period of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find reserve that need more
time to be learn. Our Kind of Traitor: A Novel can be your answer given it can be read by you who have
those short time problems.
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