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In this objective study of the texts, Maurice Bucaille clears away many preconceived ideas about the Old
Testament, the Gospel and the Quran. He tries in this collection of Writings to separate what belongs to
Revelation from what is the product of error or human interpretation. His study sheds new light on the Holy
Scriptures. At the end of the gripping account, he places the believer before a point of cardinal importance:
the continuity of the revelation emanating from the same God, with modes of expression that differ in the
course of time.
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From reader reviews:

Clementine Frazier:

The experience that you get from The Bible, The Quran and Science. could be the more deep you excavating
the information that hide within the words the more you get considering reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to know but The Bible, The Quran and Science. giving you thrill feeling of reading. The author
conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by anyone who read this because the author of this
reserve is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly
recommend you for having that The Bible, The Quran and Science. instantly.

Melanie Ratcliff:

The particular book The Bible, The Quran and Science. has a lot of information on it. So when you read this
book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes
some research ahead of write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
reading this article book.

Leticia Nielson:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will
make professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
much easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet,
classifieds, book, and soon. You will see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically
the book that recommended to you is The Bible, The Quran and Science. this guide consist a lot of the
information with the condition of this world now. That book was represented how does the world has grown
up. The dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Brandon Inouye:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Bible, The Quran and Science. can be the
respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare time by reading
in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?
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