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Aloha America reveals the role of hula in legitimating U.S. imperial ambitions in Hawai'i. Hula performers
began touring throughout the continental United States and Europe in the late nineteenth century. These
"hula circuits" introduced hula, and Hawaiians, to U.S. audiences, establishing an "imagined intimacy," a
powerful fantasy that enabled Americans to possess their colony physically and symbolically. Meanwhile, in
the early years of American imperialism in the Pacific, touring hula performers incorporated veiled critiques
of U.S. expansionism into their productions.

At vaudeville theaters, international expositions, commercial nightclubs, and military bases, Hawaiian
women acted as ambassadors of aloha, enabling Americans to imagine Hawai'i as feminine and benign, and
the relation between colonizer and colonized as mutually desired. By the 1930s, Hawaiian culture,
particularly its music and hula, had enormous promotional value. In the 1940s, thousands of U.S. soldiers
and military personnel in Hawai'i were entertained by hula performances, many of which were filmed by
military photographers. Yet, as Adria L. Imada shows, Hawaiians also used hula as a means of cultural
survival and countercolonial political praxis. In Aloha America, Imada focuses on the years between the
1890s and the 1960s, examining little-known performances and films before turning to the present-day
reappropriation of hula by the Hawaiian self-determination movement.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Bradley:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say absolutely indeed.
People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you possess when the
spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you have read will
be Aloha America: Hula Circuits through the U.S. Empire.

Gina Dana:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking Aloha America: Hula Circuits
through the U.S. Empire that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book.
Reading habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world much better then
how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky
particular person but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for every you who want to
start looking at as your good habit, you can pick Aloha America: Hula Circuits through the U.S. Empire
become your personal starter.

Leroy Barker:

The book untitled Aloha America: Hula Circuits through the U.S. Empire contain a lot of information on it.
The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very clear and understandable all the
people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author.
The author will take you in the new time of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can
keep reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site as well as order it. Have a
nice learn.

Julia Watkins:

In this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do
is just spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of several
books in the top list in your reading list is actually Aloha America: Hula Circuits through the U.S. Empire.
This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person.
By looking up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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