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*Please note: This is not a full retelling of Flat-Out Love, but rather a companion piece with select FOL
chapters, and it is meant for readers who know the story very well.*

You saw geeky, damaged, loveable Matt Watkins through Julie's eyes in FLAT-OUT LOVE. Now go deeper
into Matt's world in this FLAT-OUT MATT novella. Live his side of the story, break when his heart breaks,
and fall for the unlikely hero all over again.

Take an emotional skydive for two prequel chapters and seven FLAT-OUT LOVE chapters retold from his
perspective, and then land with a brand-new steamy finale chapter from Julie.

Author's Note: Two chapters, The Sleepover and Keep Going, contain more mature content than Flat-Out
Love (Keep Going, in particular), and were written based on reader demand. They wouldn't have fit in well
with the original Flat-Out Love, but given that this is a fan-driven companion piece, I think they work. While
the content here is upped a bit, the scenes are tastefully done. (So, you know sorry to those who wanted lewd
and graphic.)

Facebook: AuthorJessicaPark
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From reader reviews:

Jose York:

The book Flat-Out Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2) can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So just why must we leave the good thing like a book Flat-Out Matt
(Flat-Out Love Book 2)? A few of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim this book can give
many information for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer with your book. Knowledge or info
that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Flat-Out
Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2) has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Helen Leduc:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important for us. The book Flat-Out Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2) was making
you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for
you. The reserve Flat-Out Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2) is not only giving you a lot more new information
but also to get your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your
publication. Try to make relationship together with the book Flat-Out Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2). You
never really feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Daniel Downey:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are
more precious than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you must do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One
of the books in the top record in your reading list is Flat-Out Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2). This book which
can be qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and
review this guide you can get many advantages.

Wayne Hankinson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see colorful
pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this
age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So ,
this Flat-Out Matt (Flat-Out Love Book 2) can make you sense more interested to read.
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