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Science is a way of thinking about and investigating the accuracy of assumptions about the world. It is a
process for solving problems in which we learn from our mistakes. Social work has a long history of social
reform and helping efforts. Let us continue this by paying attention to the important message of this book.

--Eileen Gambrill, PhD, School of Social Welfare

University of California at Berkeley (From the Foreword)

Although many psychosocial interventions used in social work practice have strong research evidence
supporting their efficacy, a surprising number do not, potentially resulting in harmful outcomes. In this book,
the authors cast a critical eye on the reality of commonly used scientific and pseudoscientific practices in
social work today. Stressing the need for separating research-based practices from those not supported by
adequate levels of evidence, they examine the scientific and pseudoscientific bases for popular social work
interventions used in a variety of treatment settings.

The text examines the misuse of legitimate research and describes how social work education training can
and should discourage pseudoscience. The concluding chapter describes pathways through which social
work practice can become more firmly grounded in contemporary scientific research. This engaging book is
intended for courses in critical thinking and evidence-based practice and is a valuable resource for all social
work students and practitioners.

Key Features:

Promotes critical thinking regarding the evidence-based research--or lack thereof--behind a variety of●

social work interventions
Written by renowned social work educators●

Addresses the history and characteristics of pseudoscience●

Examines pseudoscience practices in assessment and work with children, adolescents, adults, and●

individuals with developmental difficulties
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From reader reviews:

Aline Moran:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
That's why, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a wander, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book called
Science and Pseudoscience in Social Work Practice? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand
beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it
has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Robert Grant:

The experience that you get from Science and Pseudoscience in Social Work Practice will be the more deep
you rooting the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to know but Science and Pseudoscience in Social Work Practice giving you enjoyment
feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood by simply anyone
who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your
own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We advise you for having this specific Science and Pseudoscience in Social Work
Practice instantly.

Robert Cobb:

Often the book Science and Pseudoscience in Social Work Practice will bring you to definitely the new
experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try
to find new book to study, this book very acceptable to you. The book Science and Pseudoscience in Social
Work Practice is much recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so
you can quicker to read the book.

Jason Young:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Science and Pseudoscience
in Social Work Practice, it is possible to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still would like to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its
identified as reading friends.
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