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***Written from the Christian viewpoint of witches. Based on an actual witch in the Bible.***

Cursed gold. A legacy of witches. A woman who dares to defy her dark birthright...

Thousands of years ago, Aaron instructed his people to create a golden calf and worship it. God punished the
idol worshipers with a plague. In modern times, the cursed gold from those idols is the legacy of the original
Witch of Endor, who once raised a prophet from the dead, but continued to follow a dark path.

Now, when Patricia Wolf, a librarian from Colorado, is summoned to her dying grandmother’s bedside in
Endor, Israel, her life takes a strange turn. Not only does she realize that her expected destiny is to become
the new witch of Endor and the guardian of the cursed gold, but she also becomes entangled in solving a
brutal murder in which her grandmother is a suspect—along with a young man who can’t seem to get his
alibi straight.

Everyone in Endor has secrets. And there’s plenty of fear in the village about her grandmother, who
proclaims herself to be the Witch of Endor. Can Patricia break the tradition that dooms women in her line to
a lifetime of guarding the cursed gold and practicing witchcraft?

A handsome preacher with a lust for gold wants Patricia to help save his son from the murder rap. She also
wants to clear her grandmother’s name and set the future on a path of goodness. Will Patricia have to choose
between her love for Dan and her duty to her grandmother? And, no matter what path she chooses, what will
happen to the cursed gold?

Danger from terrorists and obstacles that hinder justice challenge Patricia’s every move. And her
grandmother is dying. Can this brave woman change the future of her family—and the infamous village of
Endor?

THE WITCH OF ENDOR, a standalone YA Christian mystery novel is brought to life by acclaimed spiritual
author Summer Lee, who unlocks the mysteries of the Biblical past and links them to the present through
exciting quests of the heart and what-if adventures about famous—and infamous—Biblical relics.
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From reader reviews:

Concepcion Maldonado:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book The Witch of Endor. You can choose the best book
if you appreciate reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book The Witch
of Endor. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely
right, since from book you can know everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may
be known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a
book or maybe searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go
to the library. Let's study.

Bertha Greene:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has several
personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Witch of Endor. All type of book
can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Rebecca Bonnett:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. And you also
know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You should know that reading is
very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update in relation to something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is The Witch of Endor.

Carlos Thornton:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of news. Within this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the
The Witch of Endor when you essential it?
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