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So You Want My Handicapped Parking Place chronicles the complicated, and often humorous experiences
of one man's journey through life in a wheelchair. Having contracted polio as a baby and being the last of a
pastor's six children, Mario Ferrante struggled to carve out his identity as a young man and grow up to enter
the professional world, start a family, and pursue the American dream like everyone else. Despite society's
continual questioning and the seemingly insurmountable challenges thrown at him, Ferrante takes the world
head-on persevering to earn two master's degrees, one in Business Administration and another in vocal
performance. He has gone on to enjoy much success: becoming a CEO, working as a director of a Fortune
Five Hundred company, traveling to Europe and the Caribbean, serving his community as a music pastor, all
in addition to being happily married for almost thirty years and raising two kids. Ferrante's stories, organized
by chapters with titles like "Curiosity," "Mishaps," "Vegetables," and "Naysayers," demonstrate a unique
perspective to the physical and social challenges of people living with disabilities. His tenacious pursuit of a
"normal" life will make you laugh, cry, and ultimately offers inspiration for how to overcome all kinds of
obstacles.
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From reader reviews:

Yadira Singh:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means
of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the item for a while is reading.
Yeah, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is high.
For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this So You Want My Handicapped Parking
Place? book as starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Randy Anderson:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit
give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want truly
feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The So You Want My
Handicapped Parking Place? is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Phillip Permenter:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book So You Want My Handicapped Parking Place?
was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book So You Want My Handicapped
Parking Place? has many kinds or type. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or
Investigation company Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all
of book usually are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best
book in your case and try to like reading in which.

Edwina Hinkle:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the idea when
they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the actual book So You Want My Handicapped Parking
Place? to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is developing
when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the
sensation about book and reading through especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available
a book and learn it. Beside that the book So You Want My Handicapped Parking Place? can to be your friend
when you're experience alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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