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Transform your cross stitch with color BEFORE you make the first stitch! Ordinary 14-count Aida cloth
takes on new hues as you add color with RitÂ® Dye. Invent a misty background for daisies, or dab on a little
extra shading to make poppies and hibiscus flowers stand out as never before. Our step-by-step instructions
ensure that your cross stitch blooms with unique depth.

3 designs by Amy Hautman to cross stitch on hand-dyed backgrounds: Daisies, Hibiscus, and Poppies.

For additional designs using this technique, see #3814 Dye-namic Florals, featuring tulips, irises, and
sunflowers.

See our Dye-namic Technique webcast for a demo.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Gallagher:

The book More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure Arts #4173) can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a book More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure
Arts #4173)? Some of you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim this book can give many
information for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, you may give for each other; you may share all of these. Book More Dye-namic
Florals (Leisure Arts #4173) has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by open up and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Donna Moore:

The publication untitled More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure Arts #4173) is the guide that recommended to you
to read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you. The language that writer use
to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of exploration when write the book,
hence the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book
of More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure Arts #4173) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Jose Coleman:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you will get
it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure Arts #4173) can
give you a lot of buddies because by you investigating this one book you have issue that they don't and make
an individual more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than other
make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We need to have More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure
Arts #4173).

Mary Otter:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book More Dye-namic Florals (Leisure Arts #4173)
was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book More Dye-namic Florals
(Leisure Arts #4173) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private
eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are usually
make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for yourself and
try to like reading this.
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