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Authored by Celtic priests when the first Gospels of the New Testament were being created, the Celtic Texts
of the Coelbook (the last five books of The Kolbrin Bible) documents the fusion of Celtic and Druid
mysticism, Judaism and Egyptian anthropology. Some regard it as a key Celtic wisdom text because it
includes a revealing biography of Jesus with several never-before published first-person quotes. This work is
rooted in a 3600-year-old Egyptian text (the first six books of The Kolbrin Bible) written following the
Exodus.Â  It describes how Noah's Flood and the Ten Plagues of Exodus were caused by a planet (also
known as Nibiru or Planet X) that orbits our sun every 3600 years. The Egyptians called it the "Destroyer"
and the Celtic priests called it the "Frightener." Index: Print and Adobe eBook
editions[DOI:10.1572/kolbrin.coelbook] Historical Summary This story begins with Moses and the Hebrew
Exodus. Convinced their gods had failed them, the Egyptians conducted the first regional anthropological
study of the Middle East, in search of clues that would lead them to the one true G-d of Abraham.Â  They
published their findings in a 21-volume work titled The Great Book. During the last millennium BCE,
Phoenician traders translated The Great Book from Egyptian Hieratic into their own 22-letter alphabet and
entrusted a copy to the Celtic priests in Britain.Â  Inspired by the Egyptian texts, the Celtic priests wrote
their own wisdom text in ancient Celtic and called it the Coelbook. Following the death of Jesus, Joseph of
Arimathea (Jesus' great uncle on the side of Joseph, his father) founded the Glastonbury Abbey, which later
became the repository for these texts.Â  In 1184 CE, English King Henry II ordered an attack on the
Abbey.Â  The survivors secreted the remains of the texts to Scotland where they were translated into English
and eventually merged to create The Kolbrin Bible. Jesus' Connection to Britain Some historians claim the
Coelbook was inspired when Jesus and Joseph of Arimathea visited Britain together. Others claim that the
Celtic biographer of Jesus returned with Joseph of Arimathea (who owned a tin mine in Britain ) to the
Middle East, where he met Jesus and his family. Either way, historical accounts show that Joseph of
Arimathea, brought Jesus' remaining friends and family to Britain shortly after the Crucifixion to escape
persecution by the Romans and to spread Jesus' message to "the uttermost parts of the earth." Related
Titleï¿½ The Egyptian Texts of the Bronzebook: The First Six books of The Kolbrin Bible Following
Pharaoh's defeat at the hand of Moses, the Egyptians searched the Middle East for clues to the one true G-d
of Abraham. What now survives of that noble effort comprises the first six books of The Kolbrin Bible.
[DOI: 10.1572/kolbrin.bronzebook] Related Title ï¿½ The Kolbrin Bible: 21st Century Master Edition The
Kolbrin Bible dates back 3600 years and offers unique and enlightened insights from the past to both
challenge and affirm our present day beliefs. This 11-book secular anthology is nearly as large as the King
James Bible. [DOI: 10.1572/kolbrin]
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From reader reviews:

Wm Schroeder:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or info even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Celtic Texts of the
Coelbook: The Last Five Books of The Kolbrin Bible is our recommendation so you keep up with the world.
Why, because this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Robin Adams:

Typically the book Celtic Texts of the Coelbook: The Last Five Books of The Kolbrin Bible will bring one to
the new experience of reading any book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Celtic Texts of the Coelbook: The
Last Five Books of The Kolbrin Bible is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book
from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Larry Hayes:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity this is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the whole
day to reading a publication. The book Celtic Texts of the Coelbook: The Last Five Books of The Kolbrin
Bible it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were holding
enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy often the e-
book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to fund but
this book provides high quality.

Clark Abeyta:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer might be Celtic Texts of the Coelbook: The Last Five Books of The Kolbrin Bible
why because the great cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint a person. The
inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide
you to pick up this book.
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