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In The Columbia Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature, two of the world's leading sinologists,
Victor H. Mair and Mark Bender, capture the breadth of China's oral-based literary heritage. This collection
presents works drawn from the large body of oral literature of many of China's recognized ethnic
groups—including the Han, Yi, Miao, Tu, Daur, Tibetan, Uyghur, and Kazak—and the selections include a
variety of genres. Chapters cover folk stories, songs, rituals, and drama, as well as epic traditions and
professional storytelling, and feature both familiar and little-known texts, from the story of the woman
warrior Hua Mulan to the love stories of urban storytellers in the Yangtze delta, the shaman rituals of the
Manchu, and a trickster tale of the Daur people from the forests of the northeast. The Cannibal Grandmother
of the Yi and other strange creatures and characters unsettle accepted notions of Chinese fable and literary
form. Readers are introduced to antiphonal songs of the Zhuang and the Dong, who live among the fantastic
limestone hills of the Guangxi Zhuang Autonomous Region; work and matchmaking songs of the mountain-
dwelling She of Fujian province; and saltwater songs of the Cantonese-speaking boat people of Hong Kong.
The editors feature the Mongolian epic poems of Geser Khan and Jangar; the sad tale of the Qeo family girl,
from the Tu people of Gansu and Qinghai provinces; and local plays known as "rice sprouts" from Hebei
province. These fascinating juxtapositions invite comparisons among cultures, styles, and genres, and expert
translations preserve the individual character of each thrillingly imaginative work.
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From reader reviews:

Sadie McBride:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something
that they don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book The Columbia
Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from the Asian Classics). All type of book
would you see on many options. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Brian Crafton:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to remain than other is high.
To suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular The Columbia
Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from the Asian Classics) book as beginner
and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Brandon Giles:

This The Columbia Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from the Asian
Classics) are usually reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The explanation
of this The Columbia Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from the Asian
Classics) can be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple reading
food but feed you with information that perhaps will shock your earlier knowledge. This book will be handy,
you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed types. Beside that this The
Columbia Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from the Asian Classics) giving
you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we all
know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Carl Fox:

Beside this particular The Columbia Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from
the Asian Classics) in your phone, it could give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or
information. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly
be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have The Columbia
Anthology of Chinese Folk and Popular Literature (Translations from the Asian Classics) because this book
offers to you personally readable information. Do you oftentimes have book but you would not get what it's
about. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here



cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find this
book along with read it from at this point!
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