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Bad guys are not allowed to have birthdays, pick blueberries, or disturb the baby. So say the four-year-olds
who announce life's risks and dangers as they play out the school year in Vivian Paley's classroom.

Their play is filled with warnings. They invent chaos in order to show that everything is under control. They
portray fear to prove that it can be conquered. No theme is too large or too small for their intense scrutiny.
Fantasy play is their ever dependable pathway to knowledge and certainty.

" It . . . takes a special teacher to value the young child's communications sufficiently, enter into a
meaningful dialogue with the youngster, and thereby stimulate more productivity without overwhelming the
child with her own ideas. Vivian Paley is such a teacher."—Maria W. Piers, in the American Journal of
Education

"[Mrs. Paley's books] should be required reading wherever children are growing. Mrs. Paley does not
presume to understand preschool children, or to theorize. Her strength lies equally in knowing that she does
not know and in trying to learn. When she cannot help children—because she can neither anticipate nor
follow their thinking—she strives not to hinder them. She avoids the arrogance of adult to small child; of
teacher to student; or writer to reader."—Penelope Leach, author of Your Baby & Child in the New York
Times Book Review

"[Paley's] stories and interpretation argue for a new type of early childhood education . . . a form of teaching
that builds upon the considerable knowledge children already have and grapple with daily in fantasy
play."—Alex Raskin, Los Angeles Times Book Review

"Through the 'intuitive language' of fantasy play, Paley believes, children express their deepest concerns.
They act out different roles and invent imaginative scenarios to better understand the real world. Fantasy
play helps them cope with uncomfortable feelings. . . . In fantasy, any device may be used to draw safe
boundaries."—Ruth J. Moss, Psychology Today
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From reader reviews:

William Gilbert:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How many people
to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Bad Guys Don't Have
Birthdays: Fantasy Play at Four book since this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course
the knowledge in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Dorothy Pierce:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-book
you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want experience
happy read one together with theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Bad Guys Don't Have
Birthdays: Fantasy Play at Four is kind of publication which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Charles Towns:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Bad Guys Don't Have Birthdays: Fantasy Play at Four as
the daily resource information.

Gregory Medina:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by net on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is named
of book Bad Guys Don't Have Birthdays: Fantasy Play at Four. You can contribute your knowledge by it.
Without making the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is
most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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