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Anny Butler is a caretaker, first for her own brothers and sisters, and then as a director of an agency devoted
to the welfare of children. What she has never had is a real family. That changed when she met and married
Lewis Aiken, an exuberant surgeon fifteen years older than Anny. When they marry, she finds her family -- a
group of Charleston childhood friends who are inseparable, who are one another's surrogate family. They are
called the Scrubs, andthey all, in some way, have the common cord of family. Upon meeting them at the old
beach house on Sullivans Island, which they co-own, Anny knows that she has found a home. They vow,
when the time comes, to find a place where they can live together by the sea.

When bad things begin to happen -- a hurricane, a fire -- the remaining Scrubs cling together. They are
watched over and bolstered by Camilla Curry, the heart and core of their group. Annyherself allows Camilla
to enfold and to care for her. It is the first time she has felt this kind of love and support. They move to a
newisland retreat, the beginning of their long-awaited life together, andAnny must learn that some loves
carry a secret and terrible price.
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From reader reviews:

Randy Scott:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How a lot more to
be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Looking at
a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Islands LP book as this book offers
you rich details and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no
doubt in it you probably know this.

Jeremy Jones:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you have been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Islands LP, you may enjoy both. It is excellent
combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout
men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Latoya Palos:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Aim to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work
the following is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside appear likes. Maybe you answer could be Islands LP why because the great cover that make you
consider in regards to the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is actually fantastic as
the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Naomi Harris:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Islands LP which is getting the
e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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